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CONTACT CLEANER 
SPRAY 

  
 

 
 

 

      

Improves electrical conductivity and reduces friction 
and wear. The Perfects Contact Cleaner Spray is 
moisture-, rust- and corrosion-proof. It cleans, 
lubricates and protects domestic appliances, garden 
equipment, car locks, car lamp holders, plugs and 
zippers, hinges, locks and curtain rails in the house. 
Also ideal for bicycle chains and gears and can be 
used safely on metal, plastic, paint and rubber. This 
spray does not contain silicones. 

Instructions of use Store and use at room 
temperature. Shake well before use. Hold the can 
upright and spray from a distance of 20 cm. Apply 
the cleaner and let it soak in. Remove left-over and 
apply a final coating to moisture, rust and corrosion-
proof the parts. When using the cleaner on switches, 
cable-shoes, plugs and connectors, disconnect the 
power before application and move the contacts 
after applying the final coating. Do not use on 
adhesives. Use the extension straw for hard-to-
reach areas. 

List of ingredients Hydrocarbons, C11-C14, n-
alkanes, isoalkanes, cyclics, < 2 % aromatics, Butane, 
Propane, Propan-2-ol, Distillates (petroleum), 
solvent-dewaxed heavy paraffinic, Isobutane, 
Hydrocarbons, C9-C11, n, alkanes, isoalkanes, 
cyclics, < 2 % aromatics, Oleic acid, compound with 
(Z)-N-octadec-9-enylpropane-1,3-diamine 

Technical info 

CONTENT 400 ml 

 

 

Logistic info: 
FP# (EU) can dimension & type pcs/box pcs/pallet EU weight/box weight/pallet EU 

FP004998 
65X157 

Sticker label 
12 960 pcs 4,68 kg 293,56 kg 

FP# (export) can dimension & type pcs/box pcs/pallet (export) weight/box weight/pallet (export) 

FP004896 
65X157 

Sticker label 
12 864 pcs 4,68 kg 356,67 kg 

 


